
 

 
 
 
 

PROCLAMATION BY THE GOVERNOR 
AMENDING  

PROCLAMATION 20-05 and RESCINDING PROCLAMATION 20-15, et seq. 
 

20-15.12 
DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING 

 
WHEREAS, on March 16, 2020, I issued Proclamation 20-15, waiving and suspending 
statutes relating to in-person Department of Licensing eye examinations and renewals 
of driver’s licenses and identification cards; and 
 
WHEREAS, under the provisions of RCW 43.06.220(4), the statutory waivers and 
suspensions of Proclamation 20-15, et seq., have been periodically extended by the 
leadership of the Washington State Senate and House of Representatives, which I have 
acknowledged in subsequent sequentially numbered proclamations; and 
 
WHEREAS, on January 15, 2021, under the provisions of RCW 43.06.220(4), the 
statutory waivers and suspensions of Proclamations 20-15, et seq., were extended by 
Senate Concurrent Resolution 8402 until the termination of the state of emergency 
pursuant to RCW 43.06.210, or until rescinded, whichever occurs first; and 
 
WHEREAS, although the COVID-19 disease continues to persist as an ongoing and 
present threat in Washington State, the measures we have taken together as 
Washingtonians over the past 24 months, including the willingness of Washingtonians 
to take advantage of the remarkable, life-saving vaccines being administered throughout 
the state, have made a difference and have altered the course of the pandemic in 
fundamental ways; and 
 
WHEREAS, although Department of Health statistics reflect the continued persistence 
of COVID-19 and support the continuation of the state of emergency, health experts and 
epidemiological modeling experts believe that as a state we have made adequate 
progress against COVID-19 to rescind and/or modify amendatory proclamations related 
to specific health issues; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Department of Health continues to maintain a Public Health Incident 
Management Team in coordination with the State Emergency Operations Center and 
other supporting state agencies to manage the public health aspects of the incident; and 
 



WHEREAS, the Washington State Department of Licensing is now or will soon be 
able to safely provide the full range of in-office services for licensing and testing at its 
56 driver licensing offices around the state; and  
 
NOW THEREFORE, I, Jay Inslee, Governor of the state of Washington, as a result of 
the above-noted situation, and under Chapters 38.08, 38.52, and 43.06 RCW, do hereby 
proclaim that a State of Emergency continues to exist in all counties of Washington 
State, that Proclamation 20-05 and all amendments thereto remain in effect as otherwise 
amended, and that Proclamation 20-15, et seq., is terminated and rescinded effective at 
12:01 A.M. on June 1, 2022. 
 
Violators of this order may be subject to criminal penalties pursuant to RCW 
43.06.220(5). 
 
Signed and sealed with the official seal of the state of Washington on this 29th day of 
April, A.D., Two Thousand and Twenty-Two at Olympia, Washington. 
 

By: 
 
 
 /s/     
Jay Inslee, Governor 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
BY THE GOVERNOR: 
 
 
 /s/                 
Secretary of State 


